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St. Albert the Great, the patron of Albertus Magnus College, was born about 1200 into
the family of the counts of Bollstadt at Lauingen in Swabia. After a few months of study
at Bologna and Padua, he entered the recently founded Dominican order in 1223. For
the next three decades, he studied and taught in Paris and Cologne, where the young
Thomas Aquinas was among his students. In 1254, Albert was elected prior provincial of
Germany and soon after was appointed papal theologian and named Bishop of Ratisbon.
Yearning for academic life, he resigned his episcopal appointment in 1262 and returned
to Cologne for a life of prayer and study. Albert died in Cologne in 1280.

According to a contemporary, Albertus was a man “so superior in every science that he
can fittingly be called the wonder and miracle of our time.” His encyclopedic writings
include works on physics, geography, astronomy, chemistry, biology, philosophy, and
theology. He was a major figure in the introduction of the work of Aristotle to the Latin
West and was instrumental in the acceptance of human learning as an essential handmaid
to theology. In 1933, Albert was proclaimed a saint and doctor of the Church.

In the tradition of St. Albert, the College strives to promote the search for truth in all its
dimensions, providing all with the opportunity to pursue a higher education that is both
humanistically broadening and practical in its application.

This catalog details the latest available information regarding academic offerings
and information for the academic year. Albertus Magnus College reserves the right to
make any changes deemed necessary, at any time and without prior notice, to the rules
governing admission, tuition, fees, programs, curriculum, course structure and content,
granting of degrees, and regulations. Every effort has been made to ensure the accuracy
of the information in this catalog at the time of publication however, the College cannot
be held responsible for typographical errors or omissions that may have occurred.

This catalog is provided to students and applicants for their general information and
guidance only. We encourage students to confirm information and requirements with
their advisors. This catalog is for informaitonal purposes only and does not constitute
a contract, either expressed or implied, and is subject to revision at the College’s
discretion.

Students should be aware that additional requirements may be imposed for certification
or licensure (even once a plan of study has been approved) if outside licensing or
accrediting agencies impose such requirements. A plan of study may be subject to
revision to reflect such additional requirements.

 

Volume XI, August 2023

Albertus Magnus College, 700 Prospect Street, New Haven, CT 06511

General Information



2  ALBERTUS MAGNUS COLLEGE 2023–2024 Undergraduate Programs

Produced by the Office of Academic Affairs

General Information


	General Information
	Introduction: St. Albert the Great


